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CRAWFORD, TEXAS

hile I’m doing it for love, I’m
hoping to make Fort Worth
more than what it is now.’

— Don Young

‘Tutto Fellini’
Coming To Cowtown

Interview with Don Young,
Fellini Memorabilia Collector

‘WDON YOUNG’s decade-long struggle to bring a
retrospective of Federico Fellini’s body of film
work to Fort Worth paid off this year.

— Staff Photo By Nathan Diebenow
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Bush Is Back...But So Is Sheehan
CRAWFORD — National at-

tention is again focusing on
Crawford, Texas and President
George W. Bush’s annual Au-
gust vacation at his 1,600-acre
Prairie Chapel ranch, but this
year’s tune also carries with it,
as last year, the refrain of peace
mom Cindy Sheehan attempt-
ing to draw attention toward
ending the war in Iraq.

Amid a Texas heat wave and
a tidal wave of conficts in the
Middle East, Bush arrived at
the ranch Thursday night and
issued a statement regarding
the pending change of power in
Cuba. Bush encouraged all
democratic nations “to unite in
support of the right of the Cu-
ban people to define a demo-
cratic future for their country.”

He said, “I urge the Cuban
people to work for democratic
change on the island. We will
support you in your effort to
build a transitional government
in Cuba committed to democ-
racy, and we will take note of
those, in the current Cuban re-
gime, who obstruct your desire
for a free Cuba.”

Secretary of State
Condoleezza Rice, who was at
the ranch this past weekend,
encouraged Cubans to stay the
course...over there...during the
time of transition, and forego-
ing an exodus to Florida that
might be considered during a
period of uncertainty in Cuba..

This trip to the ranch marks
President Bush’s 59th. As of
Saturday, he had spent all or
part of 384 days (more than a
year of his presidency) in the
area, which has drawn consid-
erable criticism among those
who believe that presidential
vacations should be limited, es-
pecially when catastrophes
abound throughout the world.

His August vacations, where
he traditionally spends his time
getting back to nature, clearing
brush, bicycling, reading, enter-

taining foreign heads of state,
and raising funds for Republican
political hopefuls, have included
27 days in August 2001, 27 days
in August 2002, 29 days in August
2003, 13 days in August 2004, and
29 days in August 2005. Bush
tentatively plans to depart
Crawford on Aug. 13, but might
return for a short visit early next
month.

This year, he plans to limit his
vacation to 10 days, upon the
suggestion of his advisers who
have said that last year’s ex-
tended vacation ushered a dra-
matic downturn in his poll
ratings, what with the presence
of Sheehan and the emergence
of Hurricane Katrina.

According to Press Secretary
Tony Snow, Bush plans to spend
some time reading during this
vacation period, having selected

two books about former Presi-
dent Abraham Lincoln and one
about the history of polio in the
United States.

Sheehan, whose son was
killed in Iraq, last year partici-
pated in a 26-day vigil near the
Bush ranch as she sought a per-
sonal conversation with Presi-
dent Bush to ask “what noble
cause” her son had died for.
That meeting never happened,
but during the ensuing year
Sheehan kept her message
alive by traveling with peace
activists throughout the world
challenging the Iraq war. She
was in Amman, Jordan this past
week to meet with members of
the Iraqi Parliament and rear-
ranged her schedule in
Crawford to coincide with the
president’s.

Recently, she purchased five
acres of land near Crawford to
be the home of Camp Casey III,
which, according to Sheehan,
will better accommodate a larger
crowd of anti-war protesters. Ac-
cording to Sheehan, a march to-
ward the Bush ranch is planned,
along with other activities, al-
though an exact schedule is yet
to be determined.

Last year, Sheehan and com-
pany camped on the road lead-
ing to the Bush ranch,
promising not to leave until he

had met with her. At one point,
when Bush attended a Republi-
can fundraiser, his caravan sped
past Sheehan and other protest-
ers who were holding signs and
chanting at him.

Several pro-war groups last
year did verbal battle with
Sheehan and her supporters,
and similar confrontations
couild be on tap for this year,
since a grassroots pro-military
group called “American Pride”
is petitioning people to come to
Crawford between Aug. 14 and
22. In an e-mail to Military.com,
Leonard Wahl, on behalf of the
pro-military group, wrote, “We
are urging every veteran to join
the fallen families to support our
troops. This is our way to con-
front Cindy Sheehan. Soldiers
did not pick this war. We cannot
allow America to fail its soldiers
as it did in Vietnam.”

Businesses in Crawford have
seen some increases in retail
sales when Sheehan’s support-
ers come to town, but not
enough to counter the downturn
in retail sales that have seemed
to coincide with the president’s
poll rating drops. According to
State Comptroller sales tax re-
bate figures, total sales this year
in Crawford appear to be down
from last year, which tends to
signal less trade.

George W. Bush
— Lone Star Iconoclast Photo

Cindy Sheehan
— Lone Star Iconoclast PhotoAbramoff Investigators

Subpoena Christian PAC
WASHINGTON — America

21, an evangelical Christian po-
litical action organization in
Nashville, was subpoenaed last
week for documents in connec-
tion with investigations into the
Jack Abramoff scandal.

The group’s president J. Tho-
mas Smith issued a statement
denying any wrongdoing with
regard money transfers to the

Washington lobbyist’s associ-
ates. However, in a memo,
Abramoff asked a Native Ameri-
can tribe to send money to
America 21.

Abramoff, who has pled guilty
to charges of conspiring to cor-
rupt public officials, told the
Coushatta Indian tribe in Loui-
siana that a check to then-Ma-
jority Whip Tom DeLay

(R-Texas)’s Texans for a Repub-
lican Majority PAC should be
cancelled and resent to America
21.

The National Journal, a politi-
cal publication based in Wash-
ington, reported that Abramoff
said in emails that America 21
was a “critical friend.” America
21’s self-described purpose is
“educate, engage, and mobilize
Christians to influence national
policy at every level.”
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Tutto Fellini
Coming To CowtownInterview with Don Young,

Fellini Memorabilia Collector

TUTTO FELLINIANA — Don and Debra Young mount his
Federico Fellini posters at the Fort Worth Community Art Cen-
ter Gallery for a Fellini movie poster exhibit that runs until Aug.
31. The exhibit is running in conjunction with a retrospective of
Fellini’s 24 films showing at the Modern Aug. 18 - Sept. 3.

— Staff Photo By Nathan Diebenow

BY NATHAN DIEBENOW
ASSOCIATE EDITOR

FORT WORTH — Don Young
says he feels like a fish out of
water in Fort Worth, but this
feeling has been all the more
reason he wanted to bring a film
festival devoted entirely to his
favorite director, the late
Federico Fellini, to his home-
town.

“Fellini is the opposite of Fort
Worth,” Young told the ICONO-
CLAST in a recent interview. “By
bringing Fellini here, I’m expos-
ing myself in a sense and put-
ting something totally different
and fairly radical here that has
nothing to do with cowboy cul-
ture.”

Young acknowledges that
Fort Worth has its own fine arts
community, corporate though it
is, yet his goal is to use that
stage to feed new ideas to his
“conservative cowtown” neigh-
bors.

“While I’m doing it for love,
I’m hoping to make Fort Worth Continued On Next Page

more than what it is now,” he
said. “I’m just making my little
contribution to raising the
awareness level to this town, so
that it will ripple into other
things like political awareness
and involvement, and environ-
mental awareness and activism,
even though Fellini films them-
selves don’t address those top-
ics necessarily.”

Young has a lot of love for the
great Italian filmmaker — so
much in fact that his collection
of “Felliniana,” aka Fellini
memorabilia, is unrivaled. Some
of his 5,000 vintage Fellini movie
posters will be on display at the
Fort Worth Community Art Cen-
ter Gallery from now until Aug.
31.

“I collect the posters because
I love the movies. I appreciate
what Fellini did. He’s still very
contemporary. He’s probably
considered the most original
filmmaker ever. In addition to
that, he managed to win a bunch
of Oscars — the most Oscars of

any director in the world,” the
glass art business owner ex-
plained.

In conjunction with Young’s
show is Tutto Fellini, a retro-
spective of Fellini’s 24 films,
running from Aug. 18 - Sept. 3
at the Modern Art Museum of
Fort Worth. Young says that the
festival will celebrate the work
of the four-time Academy Award
winner with a film each day, lec-
tures by guest speakers and
film critics, and live music from
Orchestra Nostalgico.

THE ICONOCLAST’s Associate
Editor Nathan Diebenow
caught up with Young at his
home in Fort Worth to discuss
his interest in Fellini, the
struggle to bring these films to
Texas, and the importance of
experiencing other cultures and
points of view.

.........
ICONOCLAST: How did your

fascination with Fellini start?
YOUNG: Well, I was about 19

years old when some of my hip-

pie buddies said, “Hey, we’re
going to the movies to see
Fellini, man. Let’s go. He’s a
cool guy. You gotta check him
out.” This was back in the drug
days of the 60s. In fact the TCU
(Texas Christian University)
Theater here in Fort Worth was
showing Juliet of the Spirits
which was from ‘65, and it was
like we were seeing it in ‘69
there in the theater. We walk in
the door and marijuana smoke
filling the place.

ICONOCLAST: (laughs) This
is Fort Worth?

YOUNG: Things have
changed a lot. It’s very conser-
vative now. You wouldn’t see
that, of course, but in those
days, it was different, so Fellini
appealed to not just the hippies,

but he was speaking their lan-
guage. When I say “hippies,” I
mean the counterculture. You
know, people who were seeing
things a little different with or
without drugs. Fellini’s movies
were trippy, so to speak, in ad-
dition to being very, very deep,
good movies. You could watch
them on many levels.

Anyway, that’s how I ended
up in the theater seeing this
movie, which happened to be
Fellini’s first color movie and
the trippiest Fellini-esque
movie that he had made. It was
much different than anything
before it. It was fun. It was way
over my head. I didn’t get the
movie at all, but the visuals
were real psychedelic and col
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orful and drew you in.
ICONOCLAST: Were you an

art student at that time or was
this poster collection just a
hobby you picked up along the
way?

YOUNG: I was kind of in be-
tween high school and college
when I saw it. I started collect-
ing posters really only about 12
years ago, but I already had the
collecting gene in my system
because I collected Marvel com-
ics as a kid. I read them and kept
them religiously. My dad raised
me to collect coins, so I already
had the collecting bug.

But really with Fellini, he was
so popular world wide — liter-
ally every country in the world
liked Fellini. His films showed in
Pakistan, Russia, and all over
Europe and places where direc-
tors might only show in two or
three places, especially in those
days. As a results of that, every
country had their own poster
design which was a little differ-
ent, their own view of the movie,
so to speak. It wasn’t regi-
mented as it is now with the stu-
dios sending them the posters.

I’m in an art related business
— the art glass business — and
I have been since I was 25, so I
appreciated the posters, and
just started collecting them. I
wouldn’t say it’s an obsession.
Well, it is an obsession (laughs)
— when you’ve got 5,000 of
them.

ICONOCLAST: (laughs)
YOUNG: But it’s not just

about having the posters be-
cause I really appreciate the
films. In other words, I’m not a
complete-ist. Like with a lot of
collections, people want the en-
tire set. That’s sort of impos-
sible with Fellini posters
because there’s so many. I don’t
even know if anyone knows
what the whole set is. Some of
these sell for $50,000 a piece, so
it’s impossible for me at this
point anyway to have them all.

ICONOCLAST: What was the
first one you bought?

YOUNG: Amarcord (1973)
was the first poster I bought,
and then I didn’t buy any for a
long time. This was before eBay,
so when I wanted to buy post-
ers, I had to send off for cata-
logs. They send them out in
black and white, and you have
to pick the best ones, and some-
times, there were just the name
of the film.

I have other memorabilia, too.
I collect old books and maga-
zines from Europe. I like to read
about Fellini because not only
did he make really good films,
he was a great talker. He was a

From Previous Page

great thinker. He was a philoso-
pher basically. A lot of his stuff
is hard to come by, his inter-
views especially. He did a lot of
interviews. He never said “no”
to an interview, so I have a huge
collection of magazines from the
‘40s to today. I have a book col-
lection of several hundred vol-
umes on Fellini in about 12
languages. I know Fellini pretty
well. It’s a fascination bordering
on obsession.

ICONOCLAST: What was his
favorite color?

YOUNG: I’m not that ob-
sessed.

ICONOCLAST: (laughs)
We’ve found your limit. Well,
what strikes you the most about
his life and work?

YOUNG: It’s really an appre-
ciation. The films are it. He
made so many good ones, but
Fellini was different from all the
rest that came before him. The
more he matured you could see
it more and more. As he ma-
tured, more people tried to copy
him, but he’s one of those guys
who is so original that you really
can’t copy him, even though
people tried. You know, some
people come along, and they are
so original and so unique that to
copy them is ridiculous. It just
can’t be done.

He had this humanistic sweet
side of him, but he also had a
very cutting side that exposed
what was going on in the world
at the time from a very personal
level inside your own head to the
society at large, and he did it in

some really unusual ways. But
what a lot of people identify with
Fellini is the images. He man-
aged to create images on film
that — well, there’s an adjective
now called Felliniesque that re-
fers to something strange,
weird, bizarre, a mixing of fan-
tasy and reality. He was kind of
the first guy to do that. It’s not
that uncommon nowadays, but
no one did it quite like Fellini did
with these particular images.
When you saw his films, you
know it was a Fellini film. You
didn’t mistaken it for a
Rossellini, an Antonioni, or the
other guys. Fellini stood out
quite a bit.

ICONOCLAST: You’re pretty
much the fulcrum for this film

festival. How did you get it off
the ground?

YOUNG: I’ve been working
for 10 years to get this project
going. I wanted to see all these
films. I had heard about this
thing called Tutto Fellini, which
had played in foreign countries,
New York, and Los Angeles.
Tutto Fellini means “everything
Fellini,” so it’s all 24 of his films
that had been restored right af-
ter Fellini died in 1993.

I wanted them so bad. I
wanted a Fellini festival. You
know, I had been having Fellini
parties once a year at my house
here and have people come,
dress up, drink wine, watch a
movie, and celebrate Fellini. I
thought that we had to do this
bigger and better, so I started
contacting different organiza-
tions for a place to screen them
on 35 mm, and I realized that it
was going to take a major insti-
tution.

I approached the modern art
museum about five years ago.
The first time I contacted them,
they kind of went, “Well, maybe,
maybe not.” And then last year,
they said, “Yeah, let’s do the
Fellinifest.” It was like they
woke up one day and decided to
focus on it because Fellini still
has a modern sensibility, and
the Modern Art Museum in Fort
Worth is one of the cutting edge
institutions in the world actu-
ally. They came through for me.
They wanted to be a part of it.
They felt Fellini fit in with their
scene in there.

They helped me by contacting
the right people in Italy. It actu-
ally took years to find out who
to contact, to see who actually
has these films, and they made
us jump through all kinds of
hoops to get the films here. Of
course, you have to pay to rent
them, and you need state-of-
the-art equipment to show
them.

ICONOCLAST: Where did
these films come from exactly?

YOUNG: These 24 films are
coming directly from the film
vault in Italy, which is govern-
ment owned. It’s called
“Cinecitta International” The
films have been resorted to pris-
tine, beautiful prints. You can
rent a Fellini film on 35 mm, but Continued On Next Page

‘W
e beat Austin. We beat
Dallas. We beat Houston.
We beat them all. We got
it right here in cowtown.’

— Don Young

it’s not a restored print.
It was a real struggle get it to

Fort Worth. The films have
never been shown outside of LA,
Chicago, New York, and foreign
countries. We beat Austin. We
beat Dallas. We beat Houston.
We beat them all. We got it right
here in Cowtown. My obsession
paid off. I’m not sure we’ll have
an audience for it, but we’ll see
in a couple of weeks.

Houston, by the way, is a part
of this, and the Houston Mu-
seum of Fine Arts is going to
also show all the films, so I sent
posters to Houston, and I have
posters at the modern art mu-
seum, and I have another very
large exhibition in this arts
neighborhood here near the
Modern. I have enough posters
to fill up several museums.

As part of his Tutto Fellini film
retrospective, I just happened to
have all these posters, so we’re
having the Tutto Felliniana ex-
hibition which means “all Fellini
posters.” “Felliniana” means
“Fellini memorabilia” basically.

ICONOCLAST: So this is a re-
ally big deal. This is the first
Fellini exhibition in the Midwest
even.

YOUNG: I think so. I’ve been
trying to get the word out that
this is unique. Fellini is still
pretty high on the screen. You
know, I’ve learned to appreciate
Fellini, so I’ve shared what I’ve
learned. He still has a lot of in-
fluence on popular culture. In
fact, I have an email newsletter
I put out quarterly that’s called
Fellini News Update, that is
about Fellini’s influence on
popular culture.

ICONOCLAST: Give me some
examples. I know of only one,
which is the term “paparazzi”
was coined after the name of
one of his characters.

YOUNG: Yeah, like from La
Dolce Vita. There’s a half a
dozen words that were coined
from Fellini films. La Dolce Vita
was meant with dripping irony,
by the way. When Fellini said
“the sweet life,” it was very
ironic because it was really a
corrupt society he was talking
about.

A lot of filmmakers still emu-
late Fellini big time. More than
ever. In fact, Woody Allen is
practically a Fellini clone.

A good example is just re-
cently the largest beer company
in the world is basing their new
international campaign on
Fellini’s La Dolce Vita. They’re
using a famous scene in that
movie where the actress Anita
Eckberg is kissing this actor in
this famous fountain in Italy
called the Trevi Fountain. In
fact, they’re spending $50 mil-
lion to do it.

Every shoe company in the
world seems like they want a
Fellini shoe nowadays.

ICONOCLAST: (laughs) It’s a
world-wide brand.

YOUNG: There you go. Here
in this part of the country,
though, that’s what makes this
festival unique. I even mention
it to people who grew up here in
the ‘60s, and they go, “I’ve never
heard of the guy.” Especially in
this part of Texas, he’s pretty
much an unknown, so I’ve had a
real uphill battle trying to edu-
cate people and say, “You’re an
intelligent person. You’re inter-
ested in the arts. You’re inter-
ested in the world. You’re really
missing out on this. Catch up.
Take a look at these films and
see.” I envy them because now
they can start over.

ICONOCLAST: (laughs) Well,
I’ve read recently that Ameri-
cans are getting more isolation-
ist because of the “war on
terror,” the conflict between Is-
rael and Lebanon, and whatnot,
and so it would seem that a film
festival such as this one is an op-
portunity to expand people’s
awareness of culture outside of
our own.

YOUNG: They ’re not just
pushing away things interna-
tionally. They’re pushing away
gays, blacks, Jews, everybody.
This seems to be getting more
conservative, especially here in
Fort Worth. We’re in the most
conservative city in the most
conservative state in the whole
world right here.

And also not just isolationist
but dumber. Fellini was the kind
of director that was very popu-
lar. He was in Life magazine and
the common everyday maga-
zines back then in the ‘50s and
‘60s. He kept growing, but
America kept getting dumber
and dumber to where you men-
tion Fellini now, and they don’t
know anything about him. To me
that’s a sign that people and so-
ciety in general are dumbing
down. They can’t put out enough
effort to understand what a com-
plex artist is up to. They got to
go watch Roseanne reruns or
Friends reruns or whatever is
on TV these days. I also see it
among friends of mine. They
can’t watch it all the way
through. They either fall asleep
or they have to work a little too
hard.

I’ve found in my life that
things that are easy are rarely
worth the effort. Things that are
good, you have to work at. You
know, the best places to go
camping are hard to get to. That
kind of attitude is just like
Fellini. You have to put out a
little bit, but the rewards are
huge, and it enriches you as a
person when you take the time
to do that. But it’s hard to get the
message through to the people
because they are getting so
many counter messages from
the media, that all it matters is
how you look or what’s the lat-
est iPod or what’s the latest
song.
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RARE AND BEAUTIFUL — Debra Young helps her husband, Don, both of Fort Worth, place film
posters from his Federico Fellini collection for the Tutto Felliniana exhibit at the Fort Worth Com-
munity Art Center Gallery. The exhibit runs from now until Aug. 31. For more information, visit the
website (www.themodern.org). — Staff Photo By Nathan Diebenow

People are becoming more
homogenized, instead of beau-
tiful diversity that I recognized
in the ‘60s and ‘70s. People were
intelligent and interested in
things, and nowadays, espe-
cially in Fort Worth, with a few
notable exceptions, you don’t
see that. You see the average
person as interested in what
they’re supposed to be doing
rather than what they want to
do.

I just went to Austin, and it’s
like the ‘60s just started down
there, but it’s been that way for
a long time. When I say “‘60s,”
I’m not necessarily referring to
drugs and rock & roll. I’m talk-
ing about the consciousness
and awareness and the wanting
to learn new things and live life
to the fullest. I don’t know. I’m
just really disgusted with this
Fort Worth area — north central
Texas.

For example, environmental
issues don’t seem to matter
around here, like they do in Aus-
tin. I’ve been fighting for a year
to get people to wake up and see
that the developers, the gas
drillers, the elected officials are
taking the city away from us.
What’s good about this place is
disappearing fast — real fast.
But there’s just real entrenched
apathy here, so the developers
thrive.

We don’t even have a tree or-
dinance in this town, which is
incredible. They just clear cut
hundreds of acres all the time
and put in the same cookie cut-
ter, ticky-tacky houses, as they
used to call them. This used to
be a beautiful native prairie
here. There’s very little of it left.
I’ve tried to wake up people and
preserve as much of that as we
can. There’s a few others out
there doing it, but by and large,
most people don’t give a flip.

That has nothing to do with
anything with Fellini, but Fellini
is an inspiration of mine, a hero
of mine. Edward Abby is a big
hero of mine. Are you familiar
with Ed Abby?

ICONOCLAST: No, but he
sounds familiar.

YOUNG: He’s considered the
godfather of the environmental
movement in the United States.
He wrote a book called the

Monkeywrench Gang back in
the ‘60s. He wrote another one
called Desert Solitaire. They
are considered the gold stan-
dards of how the environmental
movement started in the United
States. He was the guy who set
it in motion.

So all my heros influenced
me, and Fellini is definitely one
of them, and if you see a few of
his films, you could see why, al-
though he is not an environmen-
talist or overtly political. But if
you know where to look, they’re
just full of political and philo-
sophical messages that people
need to be listening to.

INFO
Don Young Felliniana Archive
www.felliniana.com
The Modern
www.themodern.org
MFA Houston
www.mfah.org/films

U.S. Workers Want ‘Green’ Working Environs: Poll

Researcher Develops Net Neutrality
Test To Keep ISPs Honest

Largest Test Evacuation In
Illinois Continues This Week

MIDDLETOWN, Conn. — A new
poll indicates that an overwhelming
majority (94 percent) of American
workers want their working condi-
tions to be environmentally friendly
and energy efficient.

In addition, the Mortgage Lend-
ers Network USA (MLN) survey

found that more employers are also
moving into greener buildings.

This trend reflects the 150 per-
cent rise in the number of Lead-
ership in Energy and
Environmental Design (LEED)
certifications that the U.S. Green
Building Council has approved

over the last three years.
MLN itself is considering apply-

ing for a LEED certification — the
nation’s only standard for sustain-
able buildings — for its own pro-
posed $75 million headquarters in
Wallingford, Conn.

Plans for this building include

such amenities as a cafeteria
and break areas stocked with
free snacks from vegetables and
fruits grown in local gardens
and orchards. The company also
plans to use solar panels and
hydraulic power to fuel its sus-
tainable energy needs.

EDWARDSVILLE, Ill. — The
largest evacuation and shelter-
ing exercise, the first of its kind
in Illinois history, continued this
week here. The test is the sec-
ond in three months that coor-
dinates federal, state, and local
response units to determine the
effectiveness of the state’s plans
for a terrorist attack.

“Much of the human suffering
we saw last year following Hur-
ricane Katrina was the result of
inadequate evacuation plan-
ning,” said Gov. Rod
Blagojevich. “This exercise will
also enable us to build on les-
sons learned during our suc-
cessful pandemic flu and
terrorism exercise in May and
help us further strengthen Illi-
nois’ overall emergency pre-
paredness.”

The Prairie Thunder Exer-
cise, which began last Friday, is
a five-day simulation being con-
ducted around Edwardsville in
Madison County. The Illinois
National Guard and the Illinois
Terrorism Task Force selected
the area which contains ware-
houses, a middle school, and
two other cities.

During the drill, agencies will
conduct a variety of missions,
such as information acquire-
ment, resources distribution,
searches, rescues, and field hos-
pital set-ups. U.S. military per-

sonnel and their vehicles in-
volved in the drill would pose no
threat to the safety of the local
residents, according to officials,
adding that the locals would be
notified f the drill goes awry.

The total cost of the drill is
estimated at between $2 million
and $3 million. The local police
departments are expecting a
reimbursement for their ef-
forts.

The exercise wasn’t without
criticism post-Hurricane
Katrina mistakes from the
governor’s political GOP rival,
State Treasurer Judy Barr
Topinka.

“There is great irony in Rod
Blagojevich talking about an
emergency response exercise
in the Metro-East,” Topinka
said. “Two weeks ago, when
strong summer storms created
an actual emergency in the
Metro East, Rod Blagojevich
didn’t even bother to make a
personal visit to the region.
During my visit to the region
following these strong, summer
storms, residents asked me,
‘Where is the governor?’ That
is a question a lot of people in
Illinois have asked the last four
years.”

Last May, federal and state
agencies conducted a three-day
simulation of emergency ser-
vices in Chicago.

SEATTLE, Wash. — A secu-
rity researcher from Seattle un-
veiled a test he said that could
tell if some Internet traffic is
treated differently than others.
This test could help advocates
for “network neutrality” con-
vince Congress to back laws that
would prevent the privatization
of the Internet’s infrastructure.

At the Black Hat USA security
conference in Las Vegas last
Wednesday, Dan Kaminsky said
he intends to release his tech-
nique which he calls “TCP-based
Active Probing for Faults” as a
free software tool in the next six
months called Paketto Keiretsu,
version 3.

Kaminsky recently told the
IDG News Service that while he
believes that Congress will make

net neutrality law, his software
will users keep Internet service
providers from manipulating
their traffic.

“If you’re going to enforce by
law that networks be neutral,
the question becomes, ‘How do
you test for this?’” he said. “I’m
going to make sure that the tools
are going to be in place.”

The net neutrality fight in
Congress itself is a struggle over
ownership of quality services.
Telephone and cable companies
say they want to provide a vari-
ety of services for different fees,
but a coalition of net neutrality
advocates say that such laws
would prevent companies from
censoring content with which
they disagree as have happened
in the past.
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9/11 Panel Felt Pentagon LiedCongress Passes Bills
Allowing Offshore Oil Drilling

54 Percent Of Americans
Support Mideast Cease-Fire: Poll

Decision On Camping, Parking Ordinances Could Fall Wednesday

Real Estate

WACO — A compromise on
ordinances prohibiting parking
and camping near President
George W. Bush’s ranch could
be reached this Wednesday be-
tween McLennan County and
attorneys for Cindy Sheehan,
the peace activist who staged a
month-long vigil there last year.

The order for the compro-
mise came from U.S. District

Judge Walter S. Smith Jr. after
both sides gave two hours of tes-
timony at a hearing last Thurs-
day.

Sheehan’s attorneys argue
that the ordinances, passed last
September, are too broad and
therefore hinder free speech on
parts of the 14 county roads
around the ranch. To meet the
county half-way, her attorneys

said that it would be fair and safe
to limit the parking and tempo-
rary toilets to a predetermined
spot near the protest site.

The county’s attorney, how-
ever, noted that the ordinances
were leveled to only protect the
health and safety of area resi-
dents and protestors, the
former of whom submitted affi-

davits showing their daily
troubles during Sheehan’s vigil,
such as school buses dropping
off children. The county’s attor-
ney also stated that prohibiting
portable toilets along the right-
of-way, as the second ordinance
mandates, does not constitute a
First Amendment violation.

Sheehan’s attorney said that

WASHINGTON — A 54-per-
cent majority of Americans
back a quick cease-fire between
Israel and Hezbollah, according
to a new poll.

International Communica-
tions Research, a polling and
market research firm commis-
sioned by the Washington-
based Council on
American-Islamic Relations
(CAIR), also found that 63 percent
want the United States to remain
neutral in this Mideast conflict.

The firm conducted a random
telephone survey of 1,000
Americans from July 28 to Aug.
2. The poll’s margin of error is
+/-3 percent.

The survey also discovered
that 35 percent of Americans
see the U.S. as biased toward
Israel, Thirty-seven percent
view their government’s Mid-
east policy as being balanced
and neutral.

Only two percent believe that
the U.S. government is sided
with the Palestinians and Leba-
nese.

CAIR, during a press confer-
ence last week, called on more
elected officials to back the
opinions of their constituents
with the launch of an online pe-
tition drive called “Not in
America’s Name.”

“The Bush administration’s
Mideast policy should reflect
the opinion of the majority of
Americans, not the narrow po-
litical agenda put forward by
special interest groups,” said

CAIR Board Chairman Parvez
Ahmed in a statement.

So far, a small bipartisan
group of congressmen have spo-
ken out in support of an imme-
diate cease-fire, including Sen.
Chuck Hagel (R-Nebr.) and Rep-
resentatives David Price (D-
N.C.), Lois Capps (D-Calif.),
James Leach (R-Iowa), and Bob
Filner (D-Calif.).

In the House, Rep. Dennis
Kucinich (D-Ohio) drafted a
resolution last week calling for
President Bush to help stop the
violence between Israel and
Hezbollah.
INFO

Not In America’s Name
www.notinamericasname.org

WASHINGTON — Both
houses of Congress have
passed bills that would allow oil
companies the opportunity to
drill for oil off the shores of Loui-
siana, Florida, Mississippi, and
Alabama. Environmentalists,
however, say that the oil give-
away ignores smarter, safer,
and cheaper energy solutions
for the United States.

The Senate version, with a fi-
nal vote of 71-25 last week,
opens about eight million acres
of federal waters in the Gulf of
Mexico. This entire area is be-
lieved to hold enough gas to
power six million American
homes for 15 years and enough
oil for two months of U.S. de-
mand.

The House measure passed
in June would basically end the
federal government’s 24 year
moratorium on offshore drilling
around the majority of the At-
lantic and Pacific’s outer conti-
nental shelf.

Though the houses must still
meet to hammer out the details,
the oil companies love both
plans for the most part. States,
through the House bill, would
have the power to decide on cer-
tain distance of drilling offshore
as well as opportunities to share
in the revenues from the leases

and royalties. The Senate bill
adds 10 years to the 2012 drill-
ing moratorium in a few Florida
coast areas, but the House gave
the states the option to override
the moratorium.

Sierra Club Executive Direc-
tor Carl Pope criticized both
measures, arguing that energy
security can be obtained
through smarter energy solu-
tions that reduce America’s de-
pendence on oil while saving
fuel costs at the pump.

“Instead of increasing oil drill-
ing, Congress could be raising
the fuel economy of our cars,
encouraging the use of renew-
able energy like wind and solar
power, and adopting other exist-
ing energy-saving technologies
that cut pollution, curb global
warming, and create good jobs,”
Pope said in a statement.

He added, “We know there is
no single magic solution to our
energy problems. But if we want
to leave our children and grand-
children a healthy planet, we
must decrease our dependence
on polluting, global-warming
causing petroleum and other fi-
nite fossil fuels. We know our
nation can do it — our history
shows that there are few chal-
lenges we have not overcome
with American ingenuity.”

even though the summer vigils
will by at his client’s newly ac-
quired property in Crawford,
protestors still want opportuni-
ties to picket there.

If the county’s attorney fails to
reach a compromise with the
county commissioners as he
planned on Tuesday, the federal
judge could rule Wednesday.

WASHINGTON — THE WASH-
INGTON POST reported last week
that the Pentagon and aviation
officials might have lied to the
Sept. 11 panel about the accu-
racy of its first response to the
attacks on New York City and
Washington, D.C. in 2001.

Staff members and commis-
sioners of the 10-member panel
in fact suspected so much that
the commission met in secret in
2004 and later agreed to submit
their allegations to the inspec-
tors general for the Defense and
Transportation departments,
instead of referring to the Jus-

tice Department for a criminal
investigation.

Thomas H. Kean, the former
New Jersey Republican gover-
nor who led the commission,
told the Post that he doesn’t
know why NORAD (the North
American Aerospace Com-
mand) explained events the way
it did. “It was just so far from the
truth... It’s one of those loose
ends that never got tied,” Kean
said.

The inspector general’s office
is expected to release a report
on the accuracy of the
Pentagon’s testimony to the

commission soon. A 2005 secret
report to Congress released to
the public last week showed that
the Defense Department’s
record keeping was to blame for
the perceived falsities.

A VANITY FAIR magazine ar-
ticle that hit newsstands last
week reports that NORAD and
the FAA gave false testimony on
the 9/11 hijackings to the panel
and in the media for over two
years. According to audio tapes
from NORAD and other evi-
dence, the military had not
tracked any hijacked airliners
nor prepared itself to shoot
down United Airlines Flight 93.

Because the agencies refused
to release these tapes as well as
emails, the commission was
forced to use its subpoena pow-
ers, a move that led some mem-
bers to think they were being
mislead on the details of Sept.
11.
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Texas Takes Lead As Top Wind Energy State
WASHINGTON — Move over,

California. Texas became the
new leader in wind-power ca-
pacity in the United States this
last quarter by adding a total of
375 megawatts (MW). Texas’ to-
tal capacity is now 2,370 MW, fol-
lowed by California’s 2,323 MW,
according to the American Wind
Energy Association’s (AWEA)
Second Quarter Market Report.

The transition came after
California’s 25-year uninter-
rupted streak as a wind-power
giant, which at one time boasted
to hold more than 80 percent of
the world’s wind-power capacity.
The 1980s oil shock, however,
dropped prices enough to pro-
hibit the Golden State’s windy
renaissance.

All in all, the report shows that
a total capacity of 822 mega-

watts (MW) was created in the
first half of the year. Now at a
9,971-MW national capacity, the
10-gigawatt milestone is near
reach, but to do so would mean
problems between wind tur-
bines and military radar need to
be solved in the meantime.

In the long-term, an action
plan to provide 20 percent of the
nation’s electricity from clean,
renewable wind energy will be
released at the WINDPOWER
2007 Conference & Exhibition in
Los Angeles, Calif., June 3-6,
2007. Input for the plan is being
sought from environmental
groups, utilities, policy planners,
investors, educators, and com-
munities.

Already, it is seen that the fed-
eral production tax credit set to
expire in December 2007 should

be extended to meet the 20-per-
cent benchmark. This move

would give the wind energy sec-
tor time to reinvest in a stable

business climate, according to
the AWEA.

Bell Says TPWD Funds Raided

DEMOCRATIC CANDIDATE for Governor Chris Bell of Houston
and his two sons Connally (left) and Atlee (right) are shown with
Fred Head (second from left) of Athens, candidate for Comptrol-
ler of Public Accounts, as they ride the train on the Texas State
Railroad between Palestine and Rusk on Saturday, July 29.

AUSTIN — Democratic can-
didate for Governor Chris Bell
of Houston and his two sons,
Connally and Atlee, visited with
Fred Head of Athens, candidate
for Comptroller of Public Ac-
counts, as they rode the train on
the Texas State Railroad be-
tween Palestine and Rusk on
Saturday, July 29.

Bell and Head both strongly
support full funding for the
Texas Parks and Wildlife De-
partment to elevate if from its
present position of 49th out of
the 50 states in funds spent to
support public parks.

The People of Texas passed a
provision levying a tax on sport-
ing goods in 1993 with the stipu-
lation that the funds be spent for
the support of the activities of
the Texas Parks & Wildlife De-
partment, but subsequent Leg-
islation has been passed raiding
these funds and transferring a
large portion to the General
Revenue Fund.

Bell and Head have pledged to
return this money to the use pro-

Radnofsky Wants
To Debate Hutchison

HOUSTON — In what is shaping up
as a highly charged contest for U.S. Sen-
ate, Democratic nominee Barbara Ann
Radnofsky says that her incumbent op-
ponent, Kay Bailey Hutchison, is avoid-
ing debating her.

Radnofsky says that Hutchison has
avoided an offer to travel to Amarillo for
a public issues discussion at a location
already chosen by the Hutchison cam-
paign for a Monday, Aug. 7, public issues
discussion sponsored by the Amarillo
Chamber of Commerce and the Globe-
News Performing Arts Centre.

Said Radnofsky, “My opponent has no
valid reason to avoid the many debate
opportunities offered to her, other than her fear and reluctance
to defend her liberal spending and her ineffective legislative puff-

ery, a tactic that has never worked in
Congress. After her tour of the Per-
forming Arts Centre on Monday she will
take questions from the audience and
hold a press conference. The voters of
Texas deserve to see a public debate.”

Radnofsky will make a campaign
swing through the South Plains and
Panhandle on Aug. 9. Radnofsky’s trip
follows more than 455 campaign visits,
and she will begin with a press confer-
ence in Lubbock followed by a press
conference in Amarillo.

Radnofsky says that during her press
conferences she will discuss the issues

Texans care about including the costs of corruption and how Tex-
ans have been shortchanged, government waste, fiscal responsi-
bility, the Trans-Texas Corridor, and the inadequate federal relief
dollars for water and drought issues.

The Democrat says she will identify the repercussions to the
South Plains and the Panhandle from the massive government
waste that has become commonplace in Washington, D.C.

Radnofsky says she clearly opposes “the land grabbing, double
taxing, community ruining Trans-Texas Corridor, which repre-
sents a huge waste of over a quarter of a trillion of our tax dol-
lars.” She says she will draw attention to her opponent’s anti-Texas
vote for tolling projects in last year’s transportation bill, which
gave massive preferences to Alaska, leaving Texas a net gas tax
donor to the rest of the country, as Texas ranks 49th in the U.S. in
per capita transportation spending.

Health Insurance For All Americans By 2012: Sen. Kerry

Hutchison

Radnofsky

vided for by the People of Texas
when they supported the tax, that

being for the support of the Pub-
lic State Parks of Texas.

BOSTON — Sen. John
Kerry (D-Mass.) last Monday
called for the U.S. government
to mandate and fund a health
insurance program for all
Americans by 2012. His
speech was delivered on the
same stage in which the cur-
rent Republican governor of
Massachusetts signed a bill
this last April creating a state-
backed health insurance pro-
gram.

Sen. Kerry, a potential
presidential candidate for the

Democratic Party in 2008, told a
crowd at Faneuil Hall that the
federal Medicaid program
should be expanded to cover
children. Another program
should be created to assist
workers whose employers pass
on their healthcare costs to
them, he said.

Though Kerry failed to ex-
plain the means by which he
would legislate such a mandate,
he did propose paying for it by
removing President George W.
Bush’s tax cuts for citizens who

earn over $200,000 a year.
Kerry said that his health

care proposal remains in in-
tact from when he ran for
president on the Democratic
ticket in 2004. At the time, his
opponent’s supporters called
the junior senator a “fl ip-
flopper.”

The state  of  Massachu-
setts is already a step ahead
of him. Gov. Mitt Romney, a
Republican who is also seen
as positioning himself for a
run as president, negotiated

a healthcare  pro -
gram that the secre-
tar y  o f  the  U.S .
Department  o f
Health and Human
services has called
a “model.”

The program,
which was passed
with a Democratic
L egis lature ,  ex-
pands Medicaid for
100,000 people. An-
other 200,000 have
their premium costs

covered when
they buy private
programs.  P ri -
vate companies
also  of fer  an-
other  200 ,000
people low-cost
policies backed
by the  gover n-
ment .  The fed-
eral government
pays for the pro-
gram with  a
yearly $385 mil-
lion allocation.John Kerry
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CRAWFORD —  Blessings
were bestowed upon Camp
Casey III during an Interfaith
service held under a shaded tent
as a hot Texas sun blazed down
on the approximately 60 partici-
pants late Sunday morning.

Earlier, Cindy Sheehan began
the morning with a short press
conference about 80 yards from
where the religious service was
held, saying, “This is the fourth
time we’ve been here. Last year
we made a committment to be
here whenever George Bush is
supposed to be on vacation be-
cause he never met with me last
summer. The troops are still in
Iraq. My goal is to get the troops
home. We’re going to be doing it
here now until our goals are ac-
complished.”

It had been a year since
Sheehan made her original in-
ternationally acclaimed trip to
Crawford to ask President Bush
“for what noble cause” her son,
Casey, had died in Iraq and to
encourage the bringing home of
troops. Bush did not meet with
her during the 26-day vigil last
year that coincided with his an-
nual August vacation on his Prai-
rie Chapel ranch.

During that period, two camps
were eventually established,
Camp Casey I and Camp Casey
II. On the first day of the origi-
nal trip to Crawford, Sheehan
and other peace activists walked

t’s a beauti-
ful day in my
n e i g h b o r -
hood.’‘I

— Cindy Sheehan as she
tours Camp Casey III

Camp Casey III: It’s All About Peace

Continued On Next Page

Camp Casey III: It’s All About Peace

AS CINDY SHEEHAN (second from left, first photo) toured Camp Casey III, she commented, “It’s a beautiful day in my neighborhood.”— Iconoclast Photos By W. Leon Smith

New Vigil Begins
At Camp Casey III

in ditches to a point near the
Bush ranch where they were
blocked by law enforcement per-
sonnel from getting any closer
to the ranch.

Sheehan explained Sunday
that during their rallies last
Easter, “We had about 300
people and it (Camp Casey II)
wasn’t big enough and since
they (the McLennan County
Commissioners’ Court) passed
the ordinances that we can’t
camp at Camp Casey I, we
needed to either rent a bigger
property or buy something. We
were having trouble finding
something for rent so I decided
to buy something. When we
don’t need Camp Casey III (lo-
cated on the outskirts of
Crawford) anymore and when
the troops are home and after

CINDY SHEEHAN takes a
question at her first press con-
ference during this visit to
Crawford.

— Iconoclast Photo By W. Leon Smith

we use it as a peace camp I’m
going to donate the property to

the town of Crawford to use as
a park. We’re going to build a
playground and put in some pic-
nic benches and we’re going to
name it  the Specialist Casey
Sheehan Memorial Peace
Park.”

When asked whether local
residents were resentful about
the way the property was pur-
chased, through a third party,
Sheehan said, “A lot of people
have a third party buy land for
them. I could have hired a law-
yer, but it would have cost me
more. I think they should be
more resentful to a president
that lied to the American public
and lied to the world.

“I think Camp Casey III will
be safer than where we were
before, and we won’t be in the
way as much as we were before.

We are good neighbors. We were
good neighbors out there. If they
can’t put up with our presence
for a few weeks, when our sol-
diers and the people of Iraq are
suffering constantly because of
what our other neighbor George
Bush did, then I think they need
to learn to relax a little bit and
learn to live with us because, I
promise you, I love Crawford
and we will be good neighbors.”

Sheehan has just returned
from Amman, Jordan, where
she met with Iraqi officials, and
planned to make a formal state-
ment on Monday about that
meeting, but she mentioned dur-
ing the press conference that
her contingency had met with
several factions of opposition
parties, with the Iraq prime min
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Camp Casey III: It’s All About Peace
SPEAKERS at the Interfaith service included (from left) Baba Ifayomi (greeting Cindy Sheehan), the Rev. Diane Baker, Sheehan,

Immalhedayah Moujahed Bakhach, and the Rev. Peter Johnson. — Iconoclast Photos By W. Leon Smith

THE INTERFAITH SERVICE
was temporarily disrupted by a
man identified as William
McGlothlin of Arkanas who
shouted, “This is anarchy right
here.” — Staff Photo By W. Leon SmithFrom Previous Page

ister, and “with Iraqi parlia-
mentarians, elected officials
who have peace plans and goals
they want to accomplish in Iraq.
And all of them say that occu-
pation is the cause of the prob-
lem and the occupation has to
end.”

Following the press confer-
ence, Sheehan toured Camp
Casey III, which includes an
area of crosses, a teepee, and
roads that were recently cut
among tree-laden areas.

At one point, she commented,
in a fashion akin to the song of-
ten chanted by the late Fred
Rogers on the Mr. Rogers’
Neighborhood kids’ television
show that teaches being a good
neighbor, “It’s a beautiful day in
my neighborhood,” as she
walked among the trees.

The Interfaith service in-
cluded words of peace and unity
by several speakers, including
Baba Ifayomi of Dallas, who led
the service; Immalhedayah
Moujahed Bakhach of the Is-
lamic Center, Ft. Worth, the Rev.
Diane Baker, Methodist minis-
ter; and the Rev. Peter Johnson.

During his address Bakhach
called for an immediate halt to
the “killing of innocent people
all over the world,” a message
that was mirrored by the other
speakers.

Baba Ifayomi offered a chant,
recited by the congregation,
“Blessed be Camp Casey.
Blessed be Camp Casey.”

“We want to stay focused on
why we are here,” he said, “so
that the prayers that we pray go
out into the universe unified. We
want to be focused and unified
so that the energy we put out
moves what we want to move.”

“If there’s any goal we wish
to accomplish, we must move as
one.”

He introduced Cindy Sheehan
as one of many who have made
great sacrifices.

Sheehan recited the physical
address of the five acres of prop-
erty on which sits Camp Casey
III and said she will soon be
“registering to vote here” and
will be getting a Texas drivers’
license.

She noted that her trip to
the Middle East was an “eye-
opening experience,” and ex-
plained that she was told by
a Middle Easterner, “It’s too
late for my country,” since
many famil ies  have le f t .
“Tens of thousands of people
are dead,” and the country is
in ruins.

Sheehan said that a common
denominator of what was being
said in Amman was the need to
erase borders, “the need to
stop labeling ourselves. If you
label yourself a Christian or a
Jew or a Muslem or an Ameri-
can or a Jordanian or an Iraqi
or a Palestinian, you are label-
ing yourself as somebody it’s
okay to kill,” she said. “We
were talking about the need
for us to recognize and real-
ize that we are human beings

first. Before we are Ameri-
cans, before we are Chris-
t ians ,  before  we are
anything. We are human be-
ings first.

“No matter what we look like
on the outside, our hearts are
connected. No matter what
color we are, because colors
can change — you know, by the
end of the summer I’ll be a lot
darker than this ...  look at
Michael Jackson, he used to be
black but now he is white —
colors can change. Religions
can change. Borders can
change.”

Sheehan said that “even
President Bush’s heart is con-
nected.”

“What we have to do is re-
mind him that with every bomb
that drops in Lebanon or Pales-
tine or Israel or Iraq or Afghani-
stan, he’s killing someone who
his heart is connected to, and
you know what, he’s killing my
brothers and sisters. And I’m
not okay with that.”

Sheehan’s remarks were in-
terrupted by a man identified as
William McGlothlin of Arkansas
who disrupted the service by
shouting, just a few feet from

Sheehan, “Is your heart con-
nected to  Al  Qaeda?”  He
went on to yell,  as he was
asked to not  interrupt,  “I
spent 20 years in the Army
for people like this. ...This is
ridiculous. ...They tried to kill
us. You guys have a problem.
Why don’t you just move over
there. I’m sure they’ll let you.
This is anarchy right here.
And now the Arabs are trying
to kill us and rob us of oil.
This is disgusting.”

The man was escorted
away from the service, but
continued to shout from a
distance as the service con-
tinued with a talk by the Rev.
Johnson, who said, “Solving
your problems through vio-
lence is wrong.” He asked
how does one tell a 19-year-
old  to  solve his  problems
without  v iolence when he
sees  that  th is  is  the
government’s answer.

Baba Ifayomi concluded
the service with this: “Our
message at Camp Casey is
‘on war, we put peace.’ Where
Camp Casey has  to  go  is
where we’re going to take it.
The original sacrifices have

been made, the direction is
there, and clear. We’re going
to stay here and keep putting
out that energy. We’re going
to go back to our cities, and
keep organizing and putting
out that image of peace. We
have to find creative ways of
relaying the messages of
peace.”
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Some Things Are Better Rarely Served
As Uncle Hugh used to say,

“ You ort’n to torment fools.
They do that themselves.”

Forget the Middle East crisis,
the Iraqi Civil War or Iran’s
nukes.

What are we going to do about
Elvis’ Teddy Bear!!??

Barney beheaded it.
Not through any PB-esque

pique, understand.
Barney is a Doberman who

was supposed to be guarding the
teddy bear at a Wells, England,
children’s museum.

But you don’t want to be a Do-
berman, ‘cause pinschers play
too rough.

And evidently Mabel, as Elvis’
bedtime bruin was called, wasn’t
the kind that Barney loved
enough.

Neither were the rest of the
museum’s estimated (for insur-
ance purposes, naturally) million
dollar rare teddy bear collection.

And rare is obviously the way
Barney likes his bear.

He chewed them all up.
In the morning, museum offi-

cials reportedly put a chain
around his neck and led him . . .

OK, I’ll stop.
I should have known you

couldn’t bear up under the strain
of this story and song.

Porous Another One.
GAO investigators asked all the

questions but the right one when
18 of their number entered U.S.
border checkpoints using fake ID’s
between February and June.

The Department of Homelite
Sanquinity complained they don’t
have enough money.

Were you aware that common
sense was so expensive?

After all, a $7 an hour Austin
bartender picked off the First
Twin’s fake ID.

It was notoriety at first glance.
So if the Secret Service can’t

produce a believable phony
driver’s license, how could an
Afghani spelunking techy with a
Dell laptop he hasn’t charged
since 2001 produce even a Univer-
sity of Arkansas-Pine Bluff student
card that an Easy Mart midnight-
to-seven clerk wouldn’t catch?

Don’t misunderstand, I’m all
for hiring the visually-impaired,
but you’d think even the seeing-
eye dog would ask for identifica-
tion. Apparently in two of the
border-crossing cases, the
undercovers didn’t even get a
cursory interrogation.

Like, maybe, “Who are you?”
But the real question here is,

since we are supposed to be at
war with terrorism, and with all
this heightened insecurity on our
borders such that a Piedras
Negras plumber’s apprentice can
find happiness at half the prevail-
ing wage on a Chicago city con-
struction site, how come we
haven’t had any more attacks
from the Axis of Evil’s vile hench-
men?

It couldn’t be that somebody
just made up the boogeyman to
scare the children into being
good.

No, it couldn’t be.
Gosh, maybe we’ve won!
You Can’t Tell The Fascists
Apart Without A Pogrom!
So OK, the Republican Party in

Texas finally admitted they DID
execute a survey to determine
how strong “moderate” Republi-
can legislators are in their dis-
tricts.

The Republikanische Partei-
Zentralausschuß didn’t do it so
they could funnel money into the
fascist opposition’s campaigns
more effectively.

They wanted to find out where
the anti-gay sentiment lay so they
could ensure passage of the gay
marriage ban amendment this
November.

Right.
And a pro gay marriage cam-

paign in this state stands about
as much chance of passing as a
Volkswagen bus in a 40 mile per
hour headwind.

Even if every Republican in the
state has barbecued cholesterol
at every meal for the next decade.

Which, incidentally, most will.
Understand that in Texas, a

“moderate” Republican wants
to deny homosexuals equal pro-
tection.

Conservative Republicans
want to deny homosexuals air.

Legislative Cleansing, anyone?
Heated Exchange

The Fascist Republican trash-
mouths yucked it up over Demo-
crat Chris Bell’s assertion that, as
governor, he would dedicate his
efforts to relieving global warm-
ing.

Specifically, he said he plans a
campaign to reduce greenhouse
gasses throughout the state.

How stoopid, chided the propa-

ganda ministers of Lying Texas
Governor Tricky Ricky Perry!

The guvner of Texas cain’t do
nothin’ ‘bout no global warmin’,
even if it did exist.

Which it don’t.
Not no way, not no how!
Them dead people in California

ain’t dead; them are marijuana
overdoses or AIDS queers or they
got bird flew or sumpum like ‘at.

Uh, well, as it actually turns
out, the governor hasn’t the
power to do anything about CO

2
emissions, but the Texas Legis-
lature could.

It seems that only seven other
countries worldwide put out
more greenhouse flatulence than
Texas.

Bell’s plan to cut emissions by
80 percent would make a signifi-
cant change.

Like Big Oil is going let its pet
Legislature bite it in the quarter-
lies, or a broker in the Woodlands
is going to walk to the 7-11 to buy
cigarettes!

Now, my fellow Texans, given
a choice between naivetè and
stupidity . . .

Show Your ASS
From the Devour Your Young

department:
When the Tricky Ricky cam-

paign received two-cent checks
from members of Citizens Low-
ering Our Unfair Taxes, workers
marked them ASS 06, and cashed
them.

CLOUT fascists were upset be-
cause the legislature only cut $5
billion from Texas school funding
and wanted REAL property tax
relief.

And exploitable ignorance
among Texas school children.

Oh, no, cried the Perry pundits.
It was a misunderstanding.

ASS stands for A Small Sup-
porter.

And BULL stands for Bureau of
Uninspired Lying Lollygaggers.

Even a Texas third grader who
couldn’t pass the governor’s
TAKS test knows an ASS when he
sees one.

And he knows it from a hole in
the ground.

Hutchison Should
Debate Radnofsky
Is Libertarian Nominee

For Governor A Nobody?
U.S.  Sen Kay Bai ley

Hutchison has  just  re-
leased a column elaborat-
ing  on her  Senate
accomplishments this year,
such as supporting the PA-
TRIOT Act ,  authoriz ing
certain funds for the armed
forces in their “War on Ter-
ror,”  providing tax cuts in
order to achieve economic
growth,  authoriz ing  the
opening  of 8.3 million acres
in the Gulf of Mexico for oil
and gas  product ion,  in-
creasing Pell Grants, and
assuring that Hurricane
Rita victims were treated
fairly by the federal govern-
ment. This is what she said
she did.

Some might argue a few
of these as positives, others
as negat ives ,  especial ly
when you read between the
lines and attempt to draw
parallels of her words to
the real world.

And some, like her oppo-
nent in the race, Barbara
Ann Radnofsky, might feel
compel led  to  point  out
where Hutchison failed to
stand up for Texans, espe-
cially regarding Alaskan
pork, or simply to question
Hutchison’s cheerleading
theatrics on other issues.

And there are  other is-
sues — like immigration,
stem cell research, the con-
flicts in the Middle East,
depleted uranium, why sol-
diers coming home are not
being adequately  taken
care of, and the list goes on.

Let’s hope
Hutchison answers
Radnofsky’s chal-
lenge to debate.  We
need to know
where these two
women really stand,
what their approaches to
governance are, and who they
are looking out for “in the real
world.”

In another debate issue,
Libertarian Party nominee
for Texas governor James

Wer ner  says  something
stinks at TV station KERA
and claims that a spot in
the October debate involv-
ing his oppontents is being
unlawfully denied him. He
says that, unlike the four
other candidates in the de-
bate, he was not given an
invitation by public TV sta-
tion KERA, while IRS regu-
lat ions  require  the
not-for-profit broadcaster
to treat all candidates the
same or possibly lose its
tax-exempt status.

“Instead,”  says  Wes
Benedict, executive direc-
tor of the Libertarian Party
of Texas, “ KERA asked the
Libertarian candidate to
defend the newsworthiness
of  his campaign using a
questionnaire.

“We think it ’s unfortu-
nate that KERA chose to
treat James Werner differ-
ently by asking him to com-
plete a questionnaire that
it did not even send to the
other  candidates ,”  said
Benedict. “What’s impor-
tant is that Texas voters
have access to an open and
fair debate among all the
candidates.”

Too often, the supposed
“top candidates”  are
treated with all the atten-
tion, while “minority par-
t ies”  are  d iscr iminated
against. After all,  “It’s a
two -party  system,”  say
some.

Sure, Bell, Perry, Fried-
man, and Strayhorn have

gotten most  o f
the press by uti-
lizing campaign
tactics in order
to be heard. And
nothing is keep-
ing the Libertar-

ian candidate
from pursuing a similar
track.

But a debate on public
television should include
all the candidates.

— W. Leon Smith
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In Memory Of My Friend The Soldier

Charles Brooke Wood,
1983 - 2006

On Friday, July 14, 2006, while
I was sitting in a newsroom
pecking away at a keyboard, my
friend Brooke Wood was dying.

Brooke and I were good
friends through all of our high
school days. He was in R.O.T.C.,
and talked about becoming a
soldier all the time. I was in jour-
nalism, and talked about be-
coming a professional writer all
the time. We were on two very
different paths, but that never
stopped us from being friends.
Even when we had fights over
girls, it was just water under the
bridge.

I remember my graduation
night like it was just yesterday.
Brooke and I practically walked
the stage together, given both
our last names start with the
same letter. He told me after we
sat back down, having turned
our tassels, that he had joined
up. That night, he said, would be
his last in town, at least for a few
years.

After the ceremony, Brooke
and I went to his church, just
down the street. We were both
living in a rather small town, so
even though I did not frequent
this particular house of worship,
pretty much everyone there
knew me anyway. They were
having a going away party for
him. While he was social with all
the well-wishers, I just sat qui-
etly in the back of the sanctuary,
wondering what other radical
changes were coming down the
pipeline. We drank Red Bull and
stayed out all night, putzing
around. We had a good time, and
then I said goodbye.

I never saw him again.
He joined the Army and be-

came a demolitions expert. If it
could explode, Brooke wanted
to play with it. It was just in his

nature, I guess. He worked with
all kinds of various munitions;
even Depleted Uranium. Espe-
cially Depleted Uranium. What
with the Army dumping hun-
dreds of millions of dollars into
new DU bombs, and refusing to
research the long-term effects
of DU poisoning, maybe Brooke
was in over his head.

Fact of the matter is, Depleted
Uranium is more deadly than
Agent Orange. Millions of
people have been exposed, and
a vast majority suffers because
of it. Many die. It causes tumors,
birth defects, infections, ner-
vous system disorders and
brain damage, to name a few.
Some who are poisoned do not
know it, and pass on mutated,
irradiated DNA to their children
who are born terrifying effigies
of nature run afoul. But, it is the
best of the best. A single DU-
tipped bullet can cut through
tank armor like butter. It is one
of the most powerful weapons in
the Army’s arsenal.

And when I think about it, he
probably knew all those things
and simply did not care. He was
like that: a big fan of overwhelm-
ing force; the next few genera-
tions be damned.

Brooke served his country
with pride. Hell, he probably had
some fun too. He was a man that
Stomped on the Terra. I’d bet
Dollars to Dinars that those in-
surgents never saw what was
coming. One minute, they’re
planting a roadside bomb. The

next … Well, let’s just say he had
a sharp eye. He almost went to
sniper school.

He returned from his third
tour in Iraq this past February,
unbeknownst to me. From what
my friends tell me, he was just
fine. He had changed a lot from
being in the sand trap, in the
shit, right there, in the thick of
the fighting. He wasn’t a high

school punk anymore. He was a
soldier, and damn proud of it. We
both broke into the careers we
love; him with his bombs, and
me with my words.

According to a few accounts,
he was just fine on Tuesday, the
11th. He was partying with
friends, downing beers like only
a military man can, laughing out
loud and having a good time. All

the sudden, he fell ill. It came
out of nowhere, practically. A
brain infection. Tumors. Hem-
orrhaging. Headaches. Uncon-
trollable shaking. No energy.
And like a bullet taking the
short trip down a hot barrel, he
died just days after it was dis-
covered. His brain was so swol-
len that doctors induced a
coma. The pain was too great.

I was told about his death by
an old friend who I talk to on
MySpace.com. She asked me if
I remembered him. Like I could
forget. I found out he was en-
gaged to a girl named Sarah.
And he had a kid on the way. It
is a boy, due next March. She
found out about the pregnancy
just three days after he died.

Was my friend Brooke one of
many victims of Depleted Ura-
nium poisoning? That is the
question that is weighing
heavily on my mind right now. I
do not know, but it seems likely.
Though I have not seen him in
years, when I heard he died, the
memories came flooding back.
I remember it all, perhaps too
clearly.

From the deserts of Iraq to
the green fields of Brenham,
Charles Brooke Wood’s passing
will be lamented for years to
come. He was my friend. He
was a soldier. He placed his
faith in the barrel of a gun, the
trigger of a bomb and the policy
of a King.

The Sand Trap couldn’t kill
him. He was too good for that.
But the stink of it ... That’s what
did him in.

Pray for his son, that he may not
suffer the horrifying effects of De-
pleted Uranium upon his birth.

I have missed my friend, all
these years. Now, I will miss
him forevermore.

Charles Brooke Wood, R.I.P.

Libertarian Nominee For Texas Governor Wants Debate Spot
AUSTIN — The Libertarian

Party nominee for Texas gover-
nor recently requested a spot in
a televised debate against his
opponents in October — a spot
his party says is otherwise be-
ing denied him unlawfully.

Nominee James Werner, un-
like the four other candidates in
the debate, was not given an in-
vitation by public TV station
KERA, while IRS regulations
require the not-for-profit broad-
caster to treat all candidates the
same or possibly lose its tax-ex-
empt status. Instead, KERA
asked the Libertarian candidate
to defend the newsworthiness of
his campaign using a question-
naire.

“We think it’s unfortunate
that KERA chose to treat

James Werner differently by
asking him to complete a ques-

tionnaire that it did not even
send to the other candidates,”
said Wes Benedict, Executive
Director of the LPT. “What’s
important is that Texas voters
have access to an open and fair
debate among all the candi-
dates.”

“We have faith that KERA
and the other sponsors are go-
ing to do the right thing and in-
clude all five candidates,” he
added.

Warner, a sales executive for
a major software firm, holds a
Bachelor’s degree from
Vanderbilt University and a
Master’s degree in Spanish and
Latin American literature from
the University of California, Los
Angeles.

For more information on tax-

James Werner

exempt organizations, visit the
IRS website’s online election-
year guide and look at pages
372-375.
INFO

IRS website
www.irs.gov/pub/irs-tege/

eotopici02.pdf
Werner for Governor Cam-

paign:
www.werner4texas.com
Libertarian Party of Texas

web site:
lptexas.org
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Young Men, Alcohol, Guns — A Deadly Combination
By July 26, 1881, the reckless

young cowboy had put a hun-
dred miles between him and a
blood-splattered barroom in
Bryan.

Three days of hard riding in the
sweltering summer heat must
have seemed like an eternity to
Reuben Stillwell. But with the
Brazos County sheriff breathing
down his neck, the 21-year-old cow-
poke dared not stop.

Never in his worst nightmare
could he have imagined Satur-
day would be the fateful day that
forever changed his life. After
taking in the horse races with
his best buddy Lucien Reed, the
two adjourned to their favorite
watering hole to get out of the
sun and to quench their thirst.

Stillwell and Reed did their
drinking standing up with their
backs to the table, where the
town doctor and the Porter
brothers sat. The trio had
started an argument over a bet
at the racetrack, and now they
tried to pick a fight by taunting
the boys at the bar.

Stillwell could tell from the
look on Reed’s face that his
companion had had about all he
could take. “Let it go, Lucien,”
he advised draining the last
drop from the glass.

But the tipsy physician would not
leave well enough alone and with-
out a word of warning sprang at
Reed like an arthritic tiger. The doc-
tor landed face-first on the younger
man’s fist and collapsed uncon-
scious to the floor.

An article in the fall 1998 issue
of OLD WEST magazine described
what happened next:  “Instantly,
the Porters leaped to their feet,
and out of the corner of his eye
Stillwell saw them going for
their guns. Instinctively, he and
Reed went for their own and four
shots roared out.”

Even through the thick gun
smoke, two dead bodies were
plainly visible. Jim Porter had
taken a bullet through the brain,
and brother Cicero had caught
one in the heart.

Reuben Stillwell panicked.
Maybe a jury would see things
his way — a clear case of self-
defense — and maybe not. He
was not going to hang around to
find out.

Stillwell kept the threatening
throng covered, as he retreated
toward the door. He urged his
accomplice to join him, but
Reed turned down the invita-
tion. “I got no place to go,” he
said with a shrug and wished
his friend well.

Stillwell was long gone by the
time the sheriff arrived on the
scene. He locked up Lucien
Reed, organized a posse and
rode off in pursuit of the double-
murder suspect.

Stillwell had no way of know-
ing that the law was never hot
on his heels. After three weeks
on the run, he risked showing
his face in Waxahachie, a jump-
ing-off place for northbound
cattle drives.

He heard a beef baron from
the Pacific Northwest was hir-
ing hands to drive a herd of
longhorns all the way to the
Idaho Territory. The fugitive fig-
ured that was far enough and
signed on as “Tom Hall.”

The cow caravan provided
safe passage out of Texas, just
as Stillwell had hoped. Rather
than wander aimlessly and at-
tract attention, he stayed in
Idaho. The cold climate was a
tough adjustment, but practi-
cally everyone was a stranger

in the sparsely settled territory
and work was easy to come by.

Stillwell’s lonely existence
ended in February 1886, when
he married Anna Nelson. Only
after they tied the knot did he
tell her his terrible secret. Anna
took the truth in stride but in-
sisted he marry her a second
time under his real name.

That may have been what put
D.D. Dawson on the Texan’s
trail. The new sheriff of Brazos
County showed up in Silver City,
Idaho, in September 1887 with an
arrest warrant. After he convinced
his counterpart that well-liked
“Tom Hall” and killer Reuben
Stillwell were one and the same, the
two sheriffs and a deputy rode out
to the couple’s ranch.

Stillwell did not go along qui-
etly. No shots were fired, but
Reuben and a loyal friend put up
a heck of a fight before they
were finally subdued at gun-
point. Fearing an attempt to free
the popular prisoner, Dawson
left for Texas that very day.

Once back in Bryan, the sher-
iff had to worry about a different
kind of mob. Some folks wanted
to spare the county the trouble
and expense of a trial, but armed
guards at the jail and the ap-
pearance of Stillwell’s aged

mother silenced the lynch talk.
Encouraged by her mother-in-

law to show support for Reuben,
Anna Hall/Stillwell made the
long trip to Texas. Weakened by
the difficult journey, she soon
took sick and died.

Since there was no doubt as
to Stillwell’s guilt, his March
1888 acquittal must have been
the result of public sympathy for
his private tragedy. Jurors could
not find it in their hearts to send
the grief-stricken widower to
prison.

The story of Reuben Stillwell
does not have a happy ending.
He returned to his Idaho ranch
right after the trial but was
wiped out by the worst winter on
record.

After tending bar in mining
towns for more than 25 years,
“Tom Hall,” as he continued to
call himself, wound up a guard
at the Idaho state penitentiary.
He never remarried and died
alone in 1934 at the age of 76.

“Outlaws & Lawmen” - “Best of
This Week in Texas History” Vol.
VI is $10.95 plus $3.25 postage and
handling from Bartee Haile, P.O.
Box 152, Friendswood, TX 77549.

 And don’t forget to visit
www.twith.com.
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Turning Down The President

Okra will inherit
the earth. No ques-
tion about it.

I was in the gar-
den this morning,
racing against time and temperature
(before the day reached 100 degrees
and more —about 9
a.m.) For the second
year in a row, we let the
garden get away from
us.  We prepare and
plant with so much op-
timism, and then
something or several
things always happens/
happen to take our at-
tention from the almost daily weeding,
watering, and care requirements that
must accompany such an ambitious
endeavor.

When we planned the garden, I
hadn’t taken the job I held for almost
four months. I blame those long days
for at least part of our garden disap-
pointments. And even though we
plowed and plowed, the okra that so
successfully seeded last year became
this year the gift that kept on giving.
And giving. And giving. You have never
seen so much okra in your life. I
thought we had a lot last year, but that
was nothing compared to this year.

Those seeds produced so many
plants that they overshadowed the
squash, the peppers, the cucumbers,
watermelon, tomatoes, everything
else we so optimistically planted. To
add insult to injury, we’re completely
unable to harvest so much okra while
it’s young and tender. It’s a physical im-
possibility. They grow long and tough
before we can possibly pick them all.
This doesn’t bode well for next year
either. More okra, more seeds, more
plants, more okra, a vicious cycle.
Throw in the second year of a drought,
and you have a recipe for garden di-
saster. Most things we grow to eat
need water to live. Not so with okra. It
seems to grow no matter what. So
when everything else shrivels up and
fails, the okra thrives. Like hackberry
trees, poison oak, weeds of all sorts. Go
fig.

Somehow, miraculously, the little,
yellow, pear tomatoes survived as well.
We managed to pick about three
kazillion of them today and about a
third that many kazillion okra. (Most
of the million kazillion there were too
mature to harvest). After 30 minutes
or so in an overgrown garden filled
with insects and itchy plants — in the
hot, hot sun collecting all those tiny
little things, I developed an even
greater respect for the migrant work-

Inheriting
The Earth

ers and others who
toil in that industry,
indeed for anyone
who must work
outside when the

temperature is dangerously high (in-
cluding our soldiers in the Middle

East). I also clearly
understand now why
small tomatoes of
any kind are more
expensive than their
larger cousins.
Gleaning them is la-
bor intensive to the
max.

Always one to look
on the bright side, I considered how
lucky we were to have this wonderful
sauna opportunity at our fingertips,
right here on our ranch. People pay
hundreds of dollars a day at spas
around the country for the privilege of
washing the toxins from their bodies
by this very same process. For all you
regular folks, this is called “sweating.”
For the more delicate among you, con-
sider “perspiring” or perhaps “shin-
ing.” We were both shining from head
to toe by the time we zipped into town
to pick up a couple of parts at the hard-
ware store for our next project of the
day. This “shining” felt darn good when
the A/C hit us. We had shined right
through our clothes.

I didn’t have time until late tonight
to wash the vegetables we had gath-
ered this morning. Rinsing three
kazillion little, yellow, pear tomatoes
and about a third that many kazillion
okra allowed much time for reflection
and thought.  And do you know what I
thought? I thought that the slimy resi-
due the okra left on my hands felt
strangely similar to the stuff I pay an
arm and a leg for to de-frizz and add
shine to my hair. No, I haven’t tried it
as a conditioner yet, but I’m certainly
considering it. (And I’m pretty sure I
read somewhere that okra’s a relative
of Devil’s Claw, isn’t it?)

I thought that it must have been a
very brave (or a very desperately starv-
ing) cave man indeed that first made
the plunge to taste okra.  I mean, would
YOU eat something that looked and felt
like THAT? Remember that this was
before the invention of gumbo and
other methods of okra disguise and
embellishment. I expect there’s a les-
son here about the persistence of the
human spirit or something, the inge-
nuity of man, the courage. . . . .. All I
know for sure is that I prefer it pick-
led.

Stay out of the heat, ya’ll. Drink
plenty of water.

Recently, Miami Dolphins’ head foot-
ball coach Nick Saban was invited to join
President Bush for dinner.  The coach
turned down the President, saying he
was too busy.

You’ve got to be awfully busy to be too
busy to eat with the President. And this
wasn’t some big fundraising dinner. This
was a casual dinner at Joe’s Stone
Crabs in Miami Beach. Saban said he
was just “too focused” on the team right
now. Too focused? The football season
hasn’t even started yet! And as my
grandmother would have said, “You’ve
got to eat.”

I think Saban had every right to say,
“No.” And I don’t think he was being dis-
respectful. I’m just surprised that any-
one is too busy to have dinner with the
President. I mean, how often do you get
asked? If he invited me, I’d go – even if
there were a big game on TV, and if I
didn’t like the restaurant he was choos-
ing. I’d TiVo the game, and get a salad.

I’m sure some people think that
maybe Saban decided not to go because
he disagrees with the President’s poli-
tics. I’ve seen no evidence to support
this theory. Besides, if you disapproved
of the President’s policies, or if you just
didn’t like him, wouldn’t you want to
have dinner with him to give him a piece
of your mind? Wouldn’t you want a
chance to tell him how you’d be able to
run the country better than he’s doing?

Perhaps Saban didn’t want to join the
President because it was one of those
nights like we all have when we don’t feel
like putting on a clean pair of pants and
would just rather stay home. Or maybe
we should take Saban’s reason at face
value. Maybe he’s a focused workaholic
football coach who can’t take a break for
anything – even dinner with the Presi-
dent.

But I’m concerned that this rejection
is really going to bother the President.
To make things worse, other heads of
state might tease him about it. And I
don’t want our leader distracted and
depressed. If you didn’t like “the sneer,”
how do you think you’re going to feel
about “the pout?”

If he’s like the rest of us, he can’t help
but wonder why this guy turned him
down. It’s like when the Johnsons keep
saying they’re busy when you invite
them to dinner. Are they really busy, or
is that just an excuse?

At first, Mr. Bush will probably try to
rationalize it. He’ll tell himself things
like, “I’m not upset. I know what an im-
portant job coaching a football team is.
I’m lucky he took my call,” or “Maybe
he was afraid he’d have to pick up the
check,” or “Maybe he doesn’t eat shell-
fish.”

But then the President is bound to be
plagued by questions like, “Was it be-
cause I called at the last minute?” “Is
he holding out for an invitation from
somebody who has a more important job
than I do?” “Doesn’t he like my new
shirt?”

Obviously, by now he’s consulted with
Condi Rice and other advisors, so what’s
the President’s next move? He might
write Saban a note, saying if the coach’s
schedule ever frees up, he should just

give the President a call. But that
sounds a little desperate. The President
of the United States shouldn’t have to
beg people to eat with him. Besides, if
Saban’s too busy to go to dinner, he
might be too busy to read and respond
to the President’s note. So, if he writes
him and doesn’t get an answer, he’s

likely to be plummeted further into de-
spair.

Feeling understandably hurt, the
President could go with the “I’ll show
him” approach. He could invite all the
pro football coaches except Saban to
dinner. Then, Saban would certainly re-
gret his decision to snub the President.
Of course, if all the other coaches say,
“No,” that will only make the situation
worse.

My advice to the President is to just
move on. Don’t obsess about this. Like
the rest of us, you’ll never know for sure
why somebody doesn’t want to go to din-
ner with you. Just accept it.

I have some advice for Coach Saban,
too: for the rest of your life, don’t ever
take a break from work and be seen in
public having dinner. Secondly, if I were
you, I’d be really careful when you fill
out your tax returns.

Lloyd Garver has written for many
television shows, ranging from
“Sesame Street” to “Family Ties” to
“Frasier” to “Home Improvement.”  He
has also read many books, some of
them in hardcover. He writes the “Mod-
ern Times” column for CBSnews.com’s
Opinion page and a weekly column for
SportsLine.com. He can be reached at
lloydgarver@yahoo.com

Sen. Clinton:

Rumsfeld
Should
Resign

WASHINGTON — After previously
resisting similar statements from her
Democratic colleagues, Sen. Hillary
Rodham Clinton (D-NY) last Thurs-
day called on Donald H. Rumsfeld to
resign his post as secretary of the De-
partment of Defense.

Sen. Clinton’s call came in an inter-
view with the Associated Press after
a Senate Armed Services Committee
public hearing where she labeled the
president’s policy on Iraq “failed.”

“The secretary has lost credibility
with the Congress and with the
people,” she said. “It’s time for him to
step down and be replaced by someone
who can develop an effective strategy
and communicate it effectively to the
American people and to the world.”

Sen. Clinton has supported the
U.S.-led Iraq occupation and opposed
a deadline for troop withdrawal there.
Despite criticism from within her own
party, she is still seen as the Demo-
crats’ early pick to be their nominee
for presidential race of 2008.

Sen. Clinton blamed Rumsfeld’s
leadership for the insurgency and
sectarian fighting in Iraq, but the de-
fense secretary denied such criti-
cisms, saying that he “never painted
a rosy picture” of the war.
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No Need To Fret...Rummy’s Not Concerned
These past few weeks I had

begun to wonder if the “war” in
Iraq was still in progress.

Virtually every minute of
news time seemed to be dedi-
cated to the hostilities between
Israel and Hezbollah.

Well, I suppose if a 24-hour
news channel (that only pre-
sents live feeds about 16 hours
a day) needs a real shootin’ war
to pull in viewers instead of a
three-year-old watered down
war predicated on lies for oil
rights, the shootin’ war gets the
coverage.

To be perfectly honest, I’ve
really been getting burned out
on the whole Israel versus
Hezbollah tragedy.  Morning,
noon and night, as if nothing
else has been taking place on
the Planet.

Not even so much as a run-
away fiancé in Atlanta.

What a pleasant surprise was
in store for me today, don’cha
know.

This morning (Thursday, Au-
gust 3, 2006) I turned the televi-
sion on just in time to catch
Hillary Clinton give Donald
Rumsfeld a thorough going
over, roasting him on a spit
about 18 inches above red hot
coals.

The Secretary of Defense was
clearly out of his league.

“Under your leadership,
there have been numerous er-
rors in judgment that have led
us to where we are in Iraq and
Afghanistan,” the junior Demo-
cratic Senator from New York
chided Rummy.

“You underestimated the na-
ture and strength of the insur-
gency, the sectarian violence,
and the spread of Iranian influ-
ence.”

Among Donny’s plethora of
failures Mrs. Clinton listed the
lack of U.S. troop numbers, the
poor planning for stabilization
following Saddam Hussein’s
ouster, and the snail’s pace
progress in rebuilding the Iraqi
military.

Flanked on either side by
Chairman of the Joint Chiefs
Gen. Peter Pace, USMC, and the
head of U.S. Central Command
Gen. John Abizaid, USA,
Rummy was not having a real
good day visiting with the Sena-
tors.

Yet ,  h is  defensive  de-
meanor  and f l ippant  re-
sponses attempted to hide
the icy arrogance with which
Rummy sends brave young
Americans to senseless, un-
necessar y  death and dis-
memberment.

Had we not seen and heard
this routine from Donny so
many times before — as Sen.
Clinton pointed out when she
stated, “There’s a track record

here.  This is not 2002, 2003, 2004,
2005, when you appeared before
this committee and made many
comments and presented many
assurances that have frankly
proven to be unfulfilled.” – it’s
possible that the American pub-
lic might buy his pathos.

Instead of redeploying troops
or reducing levels, more troops
are being held over to secure
Baghdad.  Troop levels are go-
ing up, not decreasing, noted
Mrs. Clinton.

Feigning hurt and surprise in
response to the Senator’s re-
marks, Rummy shot back with
his typical homespun, “My good-
ness.”

Yeah, that’ll deflect any and all
critics.  How can they argue with

the response their old grandpas
would have given?

Then he went into his pat-
ented maneuver of asking
overly simplistic questions,
then answering them himself
with the only possible replies:

“Are there setbacks?  Yes.
Are there things that people
can’t anticipate?  Yes.  Does the
enemy have a brain and con-
tinue to make adjustments on
the ground requiring our forces
to make adjustments?  You bet.

“Is that going to continue to
be the case?  I think so.  Is this
problem going to get solved in
the near term about this long
struggle against violent extrem-
ism?  No, I don’t believe it is.”

D’oh!
For the umpteenth time, the

Defense Secretary indefensibly
defended his position by trying
to buffalo Sen. Clinton with
jabberwocky about how a pre-
mature withdrawal would leave
the fledgling democratic Iraqi
government vulnerable to at-
tack and overthrow by anar-
chists, blah, blah, blah.

What nation provided troops
to protect our fledgling demo-
cratic United States Govern-
ment when it was first learning
to crawl?

Then i t  was Sen.  John
McCain’s turn.  He finally
showed some impat ience
with the snail’s pace of the
war and occupation of Iraq.
The Arizona Republ ican
questioned both Gens. Pace
and Abizaid as to whether ei-
ther of them had anticipated
the extreme level of sectar-
ian strife a year ago.

Gen. Pace admitted that he
had not expected such vio-
lence to erupt.  An honest
statement, yet a rather myo-
pic view from the highest-
ranking person in  our
military.

Gen. Abizaid recognized
that the tensions were rising,
but had not figured on such
excessive violence.  Despite
having rarely seen a Middle
East “so unsettled and so
volatile,” Abizaid is optimis-
tic that the “slide can be pre-
vented”  and we wi l l  be
successful  in defeating al
Qaeda, deterring Iran, and
“developing a comprehen-
sive solution to the Arab-Is-
raeli conflict.”

Sen.  McCain was not so
sure of this rosy scenario.
He referred to our troops as
being engaged in  a  wide-
spread “game of whack-a-
mole”:  They go to Falluja to
deal with a problem; a week
or two later there’s a situa-
tion in Ramadi, so the troops
have to  move there  for  a
battle; then, the fight is on in

Baghdad, and on and on it
goes.  Wherever the insur-
gents or terrorists pop up,
the American troops are ex-
pected to show up.

I  f ind these answers in-
credulous.  At least one year
ago various British news me-
dia were reporting that civil
war in Iraq was inevitable.

How could it be that the En-
glish saw it clear as day, but
the Americans didn’t recog-
nize the situation for the di-
saster that was looming?

Simple:   Donald  H.
Rumsfeld and the agenda of
the entire RoveBush Fascist
Regime.

One of the first things I was
taught after beginning Basic
Training at Fort Campbell,
Kentucky, was “Hope for the
best, expect the worst.”  This
was rei terated t ime and
again throughout my Army
days; it wasn’t a suggestion,
they were words to keep us
alive.  This phrase was an
underlying tenet of both lead-
ership schools the Army put
me through.

Hel l ,  most  management
courses will  expect one to
bear this in mind.

It would serve anyone in
everyday life.

Even the Boy Scout motto
is “Be Prepared.”

Here we have the three
most powerful  men in our
military command structure,
responsible for hundreds of
thousands – mill ions — of
lives, and not one of them was
prepared to react to what
some rag-tag insurgents
might do!

By their own admission,
two generals ignored the ba-
sic military tenet of “Hope for
the best, expect the worst!”

And Secretary of Defense
Donald H. Rumsfeld basically
said to the United States Sen-
ate, “Look, it wasn’t my fault.
How could I foresee these
things happening?  You can’t
blame me.”

Rummy’s the damned Sec-
retary of Defense, the same
schmuck who in 1998 advised
President Bill Clinton to in-
vade Iraq!   Thank gawd
Clinton wasn’t a power-mad
megalomaniac lunatic!

How could none of this not
be the fault  of  anyone but
Donald  Rumsfeld ,  Dick
Cheney, Condoleezza Rice,
Paul Wolfowitz,  George W.
Bush and Karl Rove?  (Lest
we forget  Wi l l iam H.
Rehnquist and his Federalist
Supremes,  a long with the
other peripheral players...)

Before the end of the day,
Mrs. Clinton was calling for
head of Donny Rumsfeld.

Well, not exactly, but she
suggested in no uncertain
terms that it would be good
for the Nation were he to re-
sign – and the quicker the
better.

“I  just  don’t  understand
why we can’t get new leader-
ship  that  would  give  us  a
fighting chance to turn the
situation around before it’s
too late.  I think the president
should choose to accept Sec-
retary Rumsfeld’s resigna-
tion.”

Sen.  Cl inton cont inued,
“The secretary has lost cred-
ibility with the Congress and
with the people.  It’s time for
him to step down and be re-
placed by someone who can
develop an effective strategy
and communicate it  effec-
tively to the American people
and to the world.

“I am frankly tired of hear-
ing the same stories from the
administration’s national se-
curity team.  The president
changed his economic team,
he changed his White House
team – I think it’s time for
him to change his security
and defense team.”

I  agree with  ever ything
Mrs. Clinton said in these last
few paragraphs, with the ex-
cept ion of  one i tem.   She
noted that Rummy “lost cred-
ibility… with the people.”  I
doubt that he ever had that
much credibi l i ty  with  the
American public to begin with
– nobody ever voted him into
office.  Hillary was just being
tactfully diplomatic.

Speaking of  being diplo -
matic, Condoleezza has been
wearing those rose-colored
glasses  again ,  te l l ing  us
there ’s  going to  be  a
ceasefire between Israel and
Hezbollah.  That was in an
interview taped earlier in the
week for airing on Larry King
(not exactly) Live tonight.

The thing is,  she has no
idea when the ceasefire will
begin… so don’t hold your
breath.

Aah,  to  be  one of  King
George XLIII’s true believ-
ers…

Shalom, y’all.

(Jerry Tenuto is an erstwhile
Philosopher and sometime Edu-
cator.  A veteran with seven years
of service in the U.S. Army, he
holds a BS and MA in Communi-
cations from Southern Illinois
University at Carbondale.  De-
pending upon your taste in po-
litical stew, you can either blame
or thank Jerry for his weekly
“Out Of The Blue” feature in THE

LONE STAR ICONOCLAST.  Visit his
blog BLUE STATE VIEW at
illinoiscentral.blogspot.com)
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To The Editor:
Well its about time you got a

decent person to move into the
sewer state. Crawford will reap
many benefits from Sheehan.

If you want to save your town,
make your number one problem
go away, Dumbya Bush.

Or you could even
bring,Cheney back and sell
hunting trips with him to all the
residents.

Nice talk’n to ya partin’er.
Dead or alive the town is go-

ing down the tubes.
HAHAHAHAHAHA

Samuel Birtciel
To The Editor:

With generally vague docu-
mentation, and name -calling,
there are many people promot-
ing the idea of the U.S. as ag-
gressors in the middle east.

Iran’s fingerprints have been
all over the aggression and mur-
der of Americans at home and
abroad for almost 30 years.

Saddam’s fingerprints were
all over the the WMDs, he used
on his own people, and the train-
ing of terrorists to oppose we
“infidels.”

The fact that the WMDs were
spirited out of Iraq to Syria be-
fore we arrived, by the Russians,
isn’t a subject the media wants
to address. They want a way to
blame president Bush.

Iran’s fingerprints are all over
the current aggression by
Hezbollah. What is it going to
take to make people understand
that the U.S. and Israel are de-
fending themselves? Certainly,
the media has the good guys and
the bad guys mixed up.

There-in lies the problem. No
public resolve to face the facts
and the terrorists. I submit the
will is there amongst the vast
majority, it just doesn’t get
press. In recent memory, the
only aggression by the U.S. was
Monica’s war in the Balkans.
Done without the blessing of the
inept UN. We are still there.
Why?

I know why we are in the
middle east. So does the presi-
dent. The stakes are very high.

Bud Garrett, Waldport, OR.

In Response To Letters: Americans Provide Solutions to Israeli / Arab Warfare?

LLLLLETETETETETTERS TO THE EDITORTERS TO THE EDITORTERS TO THE EDITORTERS TO THE EDITORTERS TO THE EDITOR
Dear Editor:

A massive two-part scheme is
being perpetrated on our citi-
zens by the federal government.
Very few citizens are aware of it
because the feds are quietly pro-
moting it.

Part 1 started in 1994 when
the North American Free Trade
Agreement (NAFTA) was sold
to the American people as a
simple trade agreement. It had
nothing to do with free trade
because it entangled us in a for-
eign bureaucracy that actually
controlled our trade and forced
us to modify some of our laws.

Also, NAFTA caused many
citizens to lose their jobs.

Now the feds want to build a
NAFTA Super Highway
throughout our country from
Mexico to Canada. It will cost
many billions of dollars. The
right of eminent domain will be
used to condemn private prop-
erty for this highway. Also, cus-
toms inspection stations will be
moved from the borders to hun-
dreds of miles inland. Cargo will
be checked only electronically at
the borders. Go to
<www.thenewamerican.com/
a r t m a n / p u b l i s h /
article_4114.shtml> for details
of this plan.

Part 2 began in 2005 when the
feds wanted to entangle us in
the Security and Prosperity
Partnership of North America
(SPP) with Mexico and Canada.
If we enter this partnership, our
borders with Mexico and
Canada will be permanently
erased.

Obviously, the federal govern-
ment has no interest in secur-
ing our borders or we would not
have many millions of illegals
here today. The fed solution is
to eliminate our borders using
the SPP.

Concerned citizens need to
contact their U.S. Representa-
tive and their two U.S. Senators
to demand that this planned
highway be stopped and the SPP
be rejected.

Sincerely,
Nancy B. Brennan,

Camarillo, CA.

So many Americans are
communicating their inter-
pretation and recommenda-
tions on the latest warfare in
the Middle  East  between
Jews and Arabs .  That ’s
much like Paris Hilton dis-
cussing what it’s like grow-
ing up in a black ghetto. She

knows NOTHING about it.
Most  Americans know

NOTHING about the thou-
sands of years of prejudice,
hatred, fighting and animos-
ity between these two cul-
tures. By the way, who cares
what Americans think about
the topic anyway?  Not the
Arabs, nor the Jews.

Did Americans care what
Arabs and Jews felt before
we invaded the Middle East?

It’s funny how reductionis-
tic American thinking is on
this topic.  Americans use
their very American “logic”
to propose resolving ancient
customs, interactions, and
behavior of Jews and Arabs.
“They should make peace,”
is the common American re-
frain .  How can you make
peace and keep it when there
is no trust? How can Arabs
and Jews be friendly and co-
exist when there is fear and
hatred for each other?

Truth is that Americans
will NEVER have a clue what
life is like in the Middle East
until they go there on an ex-
tended visit.  I  did several
times and it left me with a
completely different impres-
sion than I first had. It was a
real eye-opener. Even doing
so simply gave me a “taste”
of life there. You don’t really
know that life unless you live
it.

The reality is that you can
cut the tension in the Middle
East with a carving knife.

Life in Israel, for example,
is  l iv ing  in  fear  o f  being
killed by missiles or by sui-
cide bombers. Yet life goes
on. Every day is another long
lesson in survival as Israeli
so ld iers  with  Uzis  stro l l
a long var ious  populated
streets and roadways watch-
ing out for anything suspi-

cious. Israel children grow
up fearful, ready to run and
hide at the slightest hint of
danger. After all, Israel is a
minority nation surrounded
on three s ides  by  host i le
Arab nations and by the sea
on the fourth s ide.  Smal l
wonder Israel has to flex its
muscles to ensure its sur-
vival.

Arab nations despise Jews
and forever refuse to recog-
nize and accept the state of
Israel .  Arab nations have
lived in the Mid-East region
together periodically both in
peace and in hostile climate
for thousands of years before
the Jews claimed Israel as
their home state (1948/49).
To  Arabs ,  Jews are  un-

wanted invaders,  inf idels
who have taken what does
not belong to them and who
pose a threat to daily Arab
life.

Is there any wonder why
there is ongoing volatility in
that region? So, who is right
and who is wrong?

For years outsiders have
proposed cease fires that go
nowhere. Treaties are for-
ever broken. Fighting and
hatred is the way of life.

Do Americans really be-
lieve their oversimplified so-
lutions will take root?

Dream on.
Peter Stern of Driftwood,

Texas, a former Director of In-
formation Services, University
Professor and Public School
Administrator, is a political
writer well-known and pub-
lished frequently throughout
the Texas community and na-
tionwide. He is a Disabled Viet-
nam Veteran and holds three
post-graduate degrees. You
may contact Peter Stern at:
<pstern@austin.rr.com>.
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